
RESOLUTION NO.  _____ 
 
Resolution Of The City Council Of The City Of Emeryville Authorizing The City 
Manager To Retroactively Accept And Expend A FY 2024 State Homeland Security 
Grant On Behalf Of The Police Department In The Amount Of $21,120 For 
Automated License Plate Readers And Increase The FY25/26 Budget By $21,120  
 
 
WHEREAS, the Emeryville Police Department applied for and was awarded a grant from 
the FY 2024 State Homeland Security Grant Program (SHSGP) to purchase up to six 
fixed-mounted Automated License Plate Readers (ALPR); and 
 
WHEREAS, the ALPR cameras to be purchased will enhance the department’s ability to 
monitor vehicle movement in real time, increasing opportunities to deter criminal activity 
and rapidly respond to in-progress incidents, all while increasing ALPR coverage and 
enhancing situational awareness to ensure a more comprehensive layer of public safety; 
and 
 
WHEREAS, the Police Department is requesting to increase both the revenue (254- 
51400) and expenditures (254-91510) for the department in the amount of $21,120 to 
accommodate the initial expense and the reimbursement of funds from the State; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Police Department will utilize the grant funds to expand its ALPR network 
to enhance public safety, improve vehicle-related investigations, deter criminal activity, 
and support real-time identification of suspect vehicles, stolen property, and persons of 
interest; now, therefore, be it 
 
RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Emeryville that the City Manager is 
authorized to retroactively accept the FY 2024 State Homeland Security Grant (SHSGP) 
and appropriate expenditures in the amount of $21,120 to accommodate the initial 
expense and the reimbursement of funds from the state and, be it, further 
 
RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Emeryville that the FY25/26 Adopted 
Budget appropriates revenue of $21,120 into Grant Fund 254 (account 254-51400) and 
appropriates expenditures of $21,120 into the Grant Fund (account 254-91510). 
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ADOPTED, by the City Council of the City of Emeryville at a regular meeting held 
Tuesday, September 2, 2025, by the following vote: 
 

AYES:    

NOES:    

ABSTAIN:    

ABSENT:    

   

  MAYOR 

   

ATTEST:  APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

   

CITY CLERK  SPECIAL COUNSEL 
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